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 
ABSTRACT 
 
Network lifetime has turned out to be the important thing 
function for comparing sensor networks in a utility precise 
manner. The Sensor nodes uses power with the aid of utilizing 
small power sources like batteries in wireless sensor 
networks(WSN); consequently, vigor usage in operating a 
Wireless Sensor Network(WSN) have to be as little as 
feasible. The Wi-Fi sensor community gift whole nodes of 
sensor creates an identical amount of packets containing 
information in the Wireless Sensor Network(WSN),sink 
nodes must relay higher packets and will be predisposed to die 
prior than different nodes considering fact that of the reality 
the power intake of sensor nodes is almost pretty much ruled 
with the support of info verbal alternate in vicinity of via 
means of sensing and processing. Thus, the overall network 
lifetime could also be stepped ahead through equilibrium 
dialog load around a sink across carefully loaded nodes and is 
the major problem of WSNs. At present, the diversity of 
networks and sincere cooperative routing method is analyzed. 
To preclude inequitable growth satisfactory on networks of 
positive type, currently we introduced one or a small number 
of nodes to transmit more packets. With any Wireless Sensor 
Networks node, both the sink and share nodes in touch. Exact 
Wireless Sensor Network (WSNs) uses cooperative type 
routing with every exceptional seeing that shared nodes 
permit sensor nodes to ahead tips from every other WSN since 
the characteristic of interchange elements amongst respective 
WSN planes. However, still the sensor nodes facing energy 
consumption problem. To avoid this problem on this paper we 
are imposing electrical power saving procedure in wi-fi 
sensor community. We will observe the reduced transmission 
energy simulation results of the energy saving on NS2 
simulator.  
 
Key words: Nodes, Routing, Transmission Energy, Wireless 
Sensor Networks.  
 
1. INTRODUCTION 
 
In modern day years, Wi-Fi sensor networks (WSNs) were 
specially utilized in packages along with fitness, army, and 
environmental monitoring. This increase has been fueled by 
means of its great reputation in wireless verbal exchange. 

 
 

However, there are boundaries because of energy constraints. 
Because of the strength stage variation, the community 
lifetime receives reduced. Therefore, big attempt is wanted to 
make it more efficient. 
 
With the use of wi-fi sensor networks, actually new program 
application domains for wi-fi adhoc networks have become 
apparent. From natural world tracking and precision 
agriculture to habitat monitoring and logistics applications, 
there is an growth identify for on developing extra 
inexperienced sensor networks. Exceptionally the 
characteristic abilities of WSN, at the facet of the constraints 
within the to be had sources (electrical power, processing 
speed, garage), distinguish sensor networks from special 
advert hoc networks. Besides these restrictions, WSN are 
additionally uncovered to countless standards, as an instance 
the more than a few densities of the node deployment, and 
sure hazardous environmental situations. Many motives 
related to sensor networks have already been investigated, e.g. 
Routing and records dissemination schemes, self-corporation 
problems, the fairway deployment of sensor nodes, and the 
interaction of sensor and actor networks (SANETs), whilst as 
others are however artwork work in growth. This includes the 
taught of group lifetime as a key perform of WSN. 
Community lifetime is possibly the highest main metric for 
the evaluation of sensor networks. Of path, in useful 
resource-limited surroundings, the consumption of every 
confined support wants to be taken into consideration. 
 
Nevertheless, network lifetime as a measure for electrical 
power consumption occupies the fantastic characteristic that 
it administrative center work and better certain for the 
applying of the sensor neighborhood. The community can 
best fulfill its intent so long as it can be some distance 
considered as alive, however not after that. It is for that reason 
a trademark for essentially the most software a sensor 
community can provide. If the metric is utilized in an 
evaluation previous a real-existence deployment, the 
anticipated community lifetime may make a contribution to 
justifying the price of the deployment. Lifetime is likewise 
considered a essential parameter within the context of 
availability and protection in networks. Network lifetime 
strongly depends upon on the lifetimes of the only nodes that 
constitute the group. This truth does no longer depend on how 
the network lifetime is outlined. Each definition can finally be 

 
An Efficient Technique for Reducing Transmission Energy of Sensor Node to 

Enhance the Lifetime of the WSN’s 

Nouf Saeed Alotaibi1 
1Department of Computer Science, Shaqra University, Kingdom of Saudi Arabia, n.saeed@su.edu.sa 

 

                                                                                                                                                                                   ISSN  2278-3091 
Volume 8, No.2,  March - April  2019 

International Journal of Advanced Trends in Computer Science and Engineering 
Available Online at http://www.warse.org/IJATCSE/static/pdf/file/ijatcse02822019.pdf 

https://doi.org/10.30534/ijatcse/2019/02822019 
 



Nouf Saeed Alotaibi, International Journal of Advanced Trends in Computer Science and Engineering, 8(2), March - April  2019, 108 - 111 
 

109 
 

 

reduced to the query even as the man or woman nodes fail. As 
a consequence, if the lifetimes of single nodes don't seem to be 
expected accurately, its miles attainable that the derived 
community lifetime metric deviates in an uncontrollable way. 
It needs to as a consequence be smooth that an accurate and 
average modeling of the unmarried nodes may be very main. 
Nevertheless, a particular discussion of the entire distinct 
techniques observed inside the literature is previous the scope 
of this paper. The life of a sensor node depends practically on 
elements: how tons vigor it consumes over time, and what 
kind of power is on hand for its use. 
 
The foremost quantity of power is ate up with the aid of the 
use of a sensor node at some point of sensing, verbal 
exchange, and info processing hobbies. A sensor 
neighborhood involves a number of those nodes. On this form 
of community, the nodes be in contact to type an advert hoc 
group and are thus ready to transmit the accrued sensor 
information to specific sinks. In principle, this is moreover 
right if in-neighborhood processing mechanisms are hired. 
 
2. RELATED WORK 
 
In wi-fi sensor networks nodes ahead the statistics they 
acquire from the environment within the path of the base 
station by way of relaying by way of multiple intermediate 
sensor nodes used as relays. If a few sensor networks are 
deployed in near proximity then they can support each others’ 
facts forwarding so that each one pursuits concerned in such 
cooperation advantage from this collaborative attempt. 
 
Kemal Bicakci, Bulent Tavli evaluate cooperation systems for 
prolonging sensor network lifetime in multi-subject wi-fi 
sensor networks by means of a linear programming 
framework. Even as their variant is certain enough to capture 
the essence of the multi-vicinity cooperation they deliberately 
restrict implementation designated knowledge. Therefore, we 
use our framework to determine close to capability 
long-established overall efficiency benchmarks in idealized 
however realistic settings. 
 
Adeniran Oluwaranti, Dauda Ayanda provided group routing 
wherein all nodes are region conscious and have the equal 
preliminary strength competencies; simulation effects 
confirmed that the group. Certainly, the reliability 
deteriorates for the reason that the operation hour ways the 
cluster head node close base station as a result of increased 
variety of failure price in a unmarried round of transmission 
of understanding. 
 
Xiaojiang Du, Yang Xiao and Fei Dai presented an 
electricity-green, self recuperation CC routing protocol for 
heterogeneous sensor networks, which is able to boom group 
lifetime with the aid of balancing sensor force intake. In CC, 

one among a form unit of cluster heads are formed for the 
period of outstanding time durations to balance the strength 
intake of L-sensors. 
 
Their results show CC balances node strength utilization 
utmost and considerably will increase lifetime of the network, 
and it performs plenty superior to different clustering-based 
totally schemes LEACH and LRS. 
 
3.  FRAME WORK 
 
3.1 Overview of Proposed Framework 
 
We regarded on this paper approximately the force saving of 
the sensor nodes together with diversity of sensor networks 
with cooperative routing approach, to keep faraway from 
unwarranted development high-quality on confident 
networks. on account that the attribute of interchange 
elements among respective WSN planes. 
 
However, in the cooperative routing different network nodes 
are communicated to switch the info to the sink node. To 
packet transmission, every sensor node may take lots of 
energy. This is the major issue for mitigating lifetime. 
 
On this framework, we are extending the previous fair routing 
concept with energy saving. Here, while sending the data, we 
are calculating the energy levels of the nodes as well we can 
depress transmission efficiency nodes by routing. To reduce 
energy consumption, we are removing the duplicate data from 
the node. 
 
3.2 Obtaining Lifetime Information of Sensor Node 
 
Neighborhood or path lifetime information if not available at 
nodes but, as an example on the time its private node lifetime 
is delivered instead. Every node more modern up these 
records without the knowledge of packets. Particularly, even 
as node without the knowledge of packets it compare the 
lifetime continuously. 
 
3.3 Pool-Based Route Selecting  
 
Now we have two route determining algorithms for fair 
routing;The primary task is Pool-founded picking. We look 
for forwarding cooperative methods for deduction of strength 
of resource useful. The Vigor Pool maintained by Shared 
Nodes, whole the electrical power utilized. 
 
3.4 Life-based Route Selecting  
 
Life-chiefly founded picking that takes path with most path 
lifetime. In evaluation, power based course option that takes 
best excellent power on the nodes, existence-founded utterly 



Nouf Saeed Alotaibi, International Journal of Advanced Trends in Computer Science and Engineering, 8(2), March - April  2019, 108 - 111 
 

110 
 

 

is focusing at the visitors lots with the aid of estimating the 
trail lifetime. Consequently, it can be miles anticipated in an 
elevated lifetime. The proposed work depends on the 
life-based route selection it means our extension work done by 
using this selection method. 

4. EXPERIMENTAL RESULTS 
 
In this analysis, we are doing simulation on NS2 simulator.  
We are taking life based selection methodology to decrease 
the vitality utilization in the far off sensor techniques. 
 

 
Figure 1: Energy consumption graph for life based selection 

 
We can view the energy consumption graph for life based 
selection (Figure 1). Here, the X-axis refers life base and Y- 
axis refers energy consumption. 
 

 
Figure 2: Comparison of Energy consumption graph for life based 

selection and pool based selection 

We can compare the existing pool based selection energy 
consumption with proposed life base routing selection energy 
consumption (Figure 2). 

5. CONCLUSION 
 
We conclude that in this paper we extended the previous fair 
routing method with energy saving. This proposed work done 
based on the life based routing selection method.  The 
transmission energy will be reduced by avoiding the duplicate 
data from the transferring data. From the NS2 simulation 
results, we proved that, we can reduce the transmission 
energy of wireless sensor hubs to spare the vitality 
additionally draw out the system lifetime. 
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